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The rapid transition from conventional in-person teaching to online learning, 
prompted by the global COVID-19 pandemic, has introduced a series of challenges 
to educational systems worldwide. Among these challenges, student satisfaction 
with the online learning experience has emerged as a crucial factor affecting the 
overall effectiveness of remote education. This study aims to assess the level of 
satisfaction and academic performance of Maktab Rendah Sains Mara (MRSM) 
students with regard to online learning during the pandemic. Through the 
utilisation of purposive sampling, a survey was conducted online, yielding 646 
responses in 2021. The objective is to gain insights into the students' perceptions of 
online education, exploring its impact on their satisfaction and academic 
achievements. Based on the findings, most respondents did not achieve satisfactory 
learning outcomes nor experience high levels of satisfaction while participating in 
e-learning during the pandemic.  
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ABSTRACT

ONLINE LEARNING SATISFACTION AND ACADEMIC PERFORMANCE: A 
STUDY OF MRSM STUDENTS DURING THE PANDEMIC 



 
This study investigates the role of teaching entrepreneurship in English and the 
inclusivity of English as an oral communication in shaping students' entrepreneurial 
self-confidence is analysed. Recent higher learning institutions have implemented 
entrepreneurship courses that are conducted in English due to its importance as a 
language of global communication and commerce. Therefore, this study seeks to fill 
the gap in previous research about the effect of language on students' 
self-confidence. To achieve the objective, a survey was conducted among the 
students of an entrepreneurship course taught in English. A total of 133 usable 
responses were obtained and used to analyse the data. Data were analysed using 
SmartPLS 4 of Structural Equation Modelling to perform multivariate analysis. The 
results revealed that independent and mediating variables have a strong effect on 
students' entrepreneurial self-confidence. Moreover, it was established that 
including English oral communication further enhances the relationship between 
entrepreneurship courses in English and self-confidence. This research contributes 
to the existing literature by highlighting the importance of language in 
entrepreneurship education, particularly the use of English for strengthening social 
capital and networking. Thus, it is essential for entrepreneurship education courses 
to be designed reflectively in regard to several other factors which will pave the way 
for students to become successful entrepreneurs. 
 
Keywords: Entrepreneurship, English, Language, Entrepreneurial Self-Confidence 

Organizer:

Co - organizer:

icar2023@kuptm.edu.my


	Full Version_v2

